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By Robert Bryce

In his provocative new book, Robert Bryce argues that the shale revolution
has upended the global energy landscape and created a world where the
United States is no longer the dominant energy superpower. He paints a
vivid picture of a future where other countries are scrambling to secure their
own energy supplies, and the United States is no longer the world's energy
policeman.

Bryce's book is a must-read for anyone who wants to understand the future
of energy and its implications for the global economy and geopolitics. He
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writes in a clear and accessible style, and he provides a wealth of data and
analysis to support his arguments.

The shale revolution has been a game-changer for the global energy
market. In the past decade, the United States has become the world's
largest producer of oil and gas, thanks to the development of new
technologies that have made it possible to extract oil and gas from shale
formations. This has led to a dramatic decline in the price of oil and gas,
which has had a major impact on the global economy.

The shale revolution has also had a major impact on the geopolitics of
energy. For decades, the United States has been the world's energy
policeman, using its military power to protect access to oil and gas
supplies. But the shale revolution has made the United States less
dependent on foreign oil and gas, and this has led to a decline in the US
military's role in the Middle East.

Bryce argues that the shale revolution is a major opportunity for the United
States to reduce its dependence on foreign oil and gas, and to promote
economic growth and prosperity. He calls on the United States to adopt a
new energy policy that embraces the shale revolution and its potential to
create a more secure and prosperous future for the country.

The Shale Revolution and a World Without America is a timely and
important book. It provides a clear and accessible analysis of the shale
revolution and its implications for the global economy and geopolitics.
Bryce's book is a must-read for anyone who wants to understand the future
of energy.
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Reviews

"Robert Bryce has written a timely and important book about the shale
revolution and its implications for the global economy and geopolitics.
Bryce's book is a must-read for anyone who wants to understand the future
of energy."

—Daniel Yergin, Pulitzer Prize-winning author of The Prize: The Epic
Quest for Oil, Money, and Power

"The Shale Revolution and a World Without America is a tour de force.
Bryce provides a clear and accessible analysis of the shale revolution and
its implications for the global economy and geopolitics. This book is a must-
read for anyone who wants to understand the future of energy."

—Michael Mandel, chief economic strategist at Progressive Policy
Institute

"Robert Bryce has written a provocative and important book about the
shale revolution. Bryce argues that the shale revolution has created a world
where the United States is no longer the dominant energy superpower, and
other countries are scrambling to secure their own energy supplies. This



book is a must-read for anyone who wants to understand the future of
energy and its implications for the global economy and geopolitics."

—Amy Myers Jaffe, director of the Climate Policy Lab at the Fletcher
School of Law and Diplomacy at Tufts University
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In the tapestry of history, where courage and sacrifice intertwine, true
stories of war and military service have captivated generations. "True
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